
Common Core Alignment: 
Grade 11-12 Speaking + Listening

STANDARD 1
Initiate and participate effectively 
in a range of collaborative discus-
sions (one-on-one, in groups, and 
teacher-led) with diverse partners 
on grades 11-12 topics, texts, and 
issues, building on others’ ideas and 
expressing their own clearly and 
persuasively.

STANDARD 4
Present information, findings, and 
supporting evidence, conveying a 
clear and distinct perspective, such 
that listeners can follow the line of 
reasoning, alternative or opposing 
perspectives are addressed, and 
the organization, development, sub-
stance, and style are appropriate to 
purpose, audience, and a range of 
formal and informal tasks.

STANDARD 2
Integrate multiple sources of infor-
mation presented in diverse formats 
and media (e.g., visually, quanti-
tatively, orally) in order to make in-
formed decisions and solve prob-
lems, evaluating the credibility and 
accuracy of each source and noting 
any discrepancies among the data.

STANDARD 5
Make strategic use of digital media 
(e.g., textual, graphical, audio, 
visual, and interactive elements) in 
presentations to enhance under-
standing of findings, reasoning, and 
evidence and to add interest.

STANDARD 3
Evaluate a speaker’s point of view, 
reasoning, and use of evidence 
and rhetoric, assessing the stance, 
premises, links among ideas, word 
choice, points of emphasis, and 
tone used.

STANDARD 6
Adapt speech to a variety of con-
texts and tasks, demonstrating a 
command of formal English when 
indicated or appropriate. (See 
grades 11-12 Language standards 
1 and 3 here for specifics.)

Comprehension + Collaboration

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.11-12.1

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.11-12.2

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.11-12.3

Presentation of Knowledge + Ideas

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.11-12.4

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.11-12.5

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.11-12.6

Our Plan for Change

Charrette

Neighborhood + Project Mapping

Y-PLAN Project Question

Interviews + Surveys

Considering Constraints

Charrette

Neighborhood + Project Mapping Interviews + Surveys

Telling the Story 

Civic Presentations

Prepare to Present

Our Plan for Change

SWOT

Prepare to Present

Digital Tour + Inspirational Slideshow

Civic Presentations

Interviews + Surveys



Common Core Alignment: 
Grade 9-10 Speaking + Listening

STANDARD 1
Initiate and participate effectively 
in a range of collaborative discus-
sions (one-on-one, in groups, and 
teacher-led) with diverse partners 
on grades 9-10 topics, texts, and is-
sues, building on others’ ideas and 
expressing their own clearly and 
persuasively.

STANDARD 4
Present information, findings, and 
supporting evidence clearly, con-
cisely, and logically such that listen-
ers can follow the line of reasoning 
and the organization, development, 
substance, and style are appropri-
ate to purpose, audience, and task.

STANDARD 2
Integrate multiple sources of infor-
mation presented in diverse media 
or formats (e.g., visually, quantita-
tively, orally) evaluating the credibili-
ty and accuracy of each source.

STANDARD 5
Make strategic use of digital media 
(e.g., textual, graphical, audio, 
visual, and interactive elements) in 
presentations to enhance under-
standing of findings, reasoning, and 
evidence and to add interest.

STANDARD 3
Evaluate a speaker’s point of view, 
reasoning, and use of evidence and 
rhetoric, identifying any fallacious 
reasoning or exaggerated or distort-
ed evidence.

STANDARD 6
Adapt speech to a variety of 
contexts and tasks, demonstrating 
command of formal English when 
indicated or appropriate. (See 
grades 9-10 Language standards 
1 and 3 here for specific expecta-
tions.)

Comprehension + Collaboration

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.9-10.1

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.9-10.2

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.9-10.3

Presentation of Knowledge + Ideas

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.9-10.4

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.9-10.5

	 CCSS.ELA-LITERACY.SL.9-10.6

Our Plan for Change

Charrette

Neighborhood + Project Mapping

Y-PLAN Project Question

Interviews + Surveys

Considering Constraints

Charrette

Neighborhood + Project Mapping

Interviews + Surveys

Telling the Story 

Civic Presentations

Prepare to Present

Our Plan for Change

SWOT

Prepare to Present

Digital Tour + Inspirational Slideshow

Civic Presentations

Interviews + Surveys


